E & A Consulting Group, Inc.
10909 Mill Valley Road, Ste 100
Omaha, NE 68154

Bid Tabulations
SID 609, Calarosa

Storm Sewer and Paving System - Section IV

Bid Date:1/26/2023

E&A Project No. 2021.280.001
Engineer's Est: $4,234,000.00

Page 1 of 2
K2 Construction Luxa Construction Valley Corp. TAB Construction
7701 Cornhusker HWY 925 E Dixon Road P.O. Box 589 4153 S 67th Street
Lincoln, NE 68507 Blair, NE 68008 Valley, NE 68064 Omaha, NE 68117
Bid Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 REMOVE END OF ROAD MARKER 18 EA 130.00 2,340.00 0.10 1.80 45.08 811.44 16.40 295.20
2 REMOVE CONCRETE HEADER 150 LF 8.50 1,275.00 0.10 15.00 11.59 1,738.50 8.10 1,215.00
3 CONSTRUCT 7" CONCRETE PAVEMENT (TYPE L65 W/ INTEGRAL CURB) 32,592 | SY 55.45 1,807,226.40 51.00 1,662,192.00 54.58 1,778,871.36 53.45 1,742,042.40
4 SUBGRADE PREPARATION 10,864 | CY 3.65 39,653.60 5.00 54,320.00 3.93 42,695.52 10.90 118,417.60
5 TIE BARS 60 EA 10.00 600.00 15.00 900.00 7.78 466.80 9.15 549.00
6 EXCAVATION ON-SITE (ESTABLISHED QUANTITY) 5,000 CY 4.70 23,500.00 4.00 20,000.00 6.47 32,350.00 4.75 23,750.00
7 ADJUST MANHOLE TO GRADE 69 EA 200.00 13,800.00 175.00 12,075.00 242.63 16,741.47 341.50 23,563.50
8 8'-0" x 12-0" BOX CULVERT 108 LF 3,000.00 323,100.00 2,000.00 215,400.00 || @ -=-- - 2,161.80 232,825.86
9 CONSTRUCT 18" RCP, CLASS Il 3,336 LF 62.00 206,832.00 62.00 206,832.00 58.89 196,457.04 67.90 226,514.40
10 CONSTRUCT 24" RCP, CLASS Il 979 LF 82.00 80,278.00 89.00 87,131.00 79.54 77,869.66 86.90 85,075.10
11 CONSTRUCT 30" RCP, CLASS IlI 982 LF 124.00 121,768.00 119.00 116,858.00 109.38 107,411.16 114.90 112,831.80
12 CONSTRUCT 36" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 1,426 LF 154.00 219,604.00 160.00 228,160.00 152.39 217,308.14 154.20 219,889.20
13 CONSTRUCT 42" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 678 LF 230.00 155,940.00 217.00 147,126.00 204.58 138,705.24 206.10 139,735.80
14 CONSTRUCT 48" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 710 LF 250.00 177,500.00 260.00 184,600.00 243.55 172,920.50 238.20 169,122.00
15 CONSTRUCT 54" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 154 EA 310.00 47,740.00 332.00 51,128.00 281.62 43,369.48 295.70 45,537.80
16 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET - TYPE | 39 EA 4,800.00 187,200.00 5,200.00 202,800.00 5,064.11 197,500.29 4,643.50 181,096.50
17 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET - TYPE il 16 EA 5,250.00 84,000.00 5,300.00 84,800.00 5,989.17 95,826.72 6,257.00 100,112.00
18 CONSTRUCT 54" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (23) 158 VF 1,000.00 158,000.00 1,050.00 165,900.00 907.27 143,348.66 1,015.30 160,417.40
19 CONSTRUCT 60" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (6) 53 VF 1,250.00 66,250.00 1,200.00 63,600.00 970.49 51,435.97 1,084.50 57,478.50
20 CONSTRUCT 72" 1.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (3) 25 VF 1,300.00 32,500.00 1,400.00 35,000.00 1,272.72 31,818.00 1,299.10 32,477.50
21 CONSTRUCT 60" AREA INLET - TYPE Il 18 VF 1,950.00 35,100.00 1,800.00 32,400.00 923.16 16,616.88 1,140.90 20,536.20
22 CONSTRUCT 24" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 4,000.00 4,000.00 3,050.00 3,050.00 1,772.11 1,772.11 2,639.70 2,639.70
23 CONSTRUCT 36" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 5,000.00 5,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 2,489.75 2,489.75 3,342.60 3,342.60
24 CONSTRUCT 42" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 5,500.00 5,500.00 11,000.00 11,000.00 3,112.13 3,112.13 4,448.20 4,448.20
25 CONSTRUCT 48" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 7,200.00 7,200.00 6,300.00 6,300.00 3,759.56 3,759.56 4,833.10 4,833.10
26 CONSTRUCT 54" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 8,000.00 8,000.00 7,000.00 7,000.00 4,486.16 4,486.16 5,451.80 5,451.80
27 CONSTRUCT 30" PIPE PLUG 1 EA 600.00 600.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 449.82 449.82 1,192.00 1,192.00
28 REMOVE 18" PIPE PLUG 3 EA 235.00 705.00 500.00 1,500.00 154.93 464.79 286.00 858.00
29 REMOVE 30" PIPE PLUG 1 EA 235.00 235.00 650.00 650.00 235.37 235.37 632.20 632.20
30 INSTALL PIPE COUPLERS 15 EA 125.00 1,875.00 175.00 2,625.00 124.15 1,862.25 114.90 1,723.50
31 CONSTRUCT TYPE B RIP-RAP 246 ™ 95.00 23,370.00 120.00 29,520.00 83.53 20,548.38 93.60 23,025.60
32 CONSTRUCT TYPE C RIP-RAP 59 ™ 98.00 5,782.00 100.00 5,900.00 93.70 5,528.30 98.65 5,820.35
33 CONSTRUCT STREET NAME SIGN 30 EA 145.00 4,350.00 120.00 3,600.00 128.92 3,867.60 178.30 5,349.00
34 CONSTRUCT SIGN POST 15 EA 195.00 2,925.00 160.00 2,400.00 175.80 2,637.00 178.30 2,674.50
35 INSTALL SEEDING - TYPE A 2,500 SY 1.25 3,125.00 0.50 1,250.00 0.59 1,475.00 0.60 1,500.00
36 INSTALL EROSION CONTROL MATTING 2,500 SY 3.60 9,000.00 1.20 3,000.00 1.29 3,225.00 1.30 3,250.00
37 INSTALL SILT FENCE 500 LF 3.60 1,800.00 3.00 1,500.00 3.21 1,605.00 3.30 1,650.00
38 JET EXISTING SANITARY SEWER 10,138 LF 1.00 10,138.00 1.00 10,138.00 0.94 9,529.72 0.95 9,631.10
39 PROVIDE TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LS 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,100.00 2,100.00 2,285.34 2,285.34 2,080.20 2,080.20
40 CONSTRUCT 6" PCC MEDIAN SURFACING 246 SF 64.00 15,744.00 10.50 2,583.00 10.00 2,460.00 12.85 3,161.10
41 INSTALL PERMANENT PAINT MARKING - 5" WHITE 100 LF 6.50 650.00 5.50 550.00 5.86 586.00 25.85 2,585.00
42 CONSTRUCT END OF ROAD MARKER 3 EA 460.00 1,380.00 100.00 300.00 186.75 560.25 200.70 602.10
43 STAIN & SEAL 950 SF 10.00 9,500.00 25.00 23,750.00 7.97 7,571.50 8.00 7,600.00
44 WINGWALLS/ HEADWALLS - KESTREL PARKWAY 2,950 SF 14.00 41,300.00 88.00 259,600.00 100.04 295,118.00 93.10 274,645.00
45 CONSTRUCT 72" AREA INLET - TYPE Il 20 VF 1,825.00 36,500.00 1,700.00 34,000.00 1,077.94 21,558.80 1,320.50 26,410.00
46 REMOVE SURCHARGE 6,500 CY 5.75 37,375.00 5.25 34,125.00 4.73 30,745.00 6.25 40,625.00
47 REMOVE 48" CGMP 190 LF 45.00 8,550.00 15.00 2,850.00 25.41 4,827.90 14.25 2,707.50
48 8'-0" x 12'-0" PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT 107 LF 2,560.00 273,920.00 mmmm——- ] 2,209.53 236,419.71 2,280.30 243,992.10
49 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET — TYPE Il 1 EA 4,865.00 4,865.00 5,250.00 5,250.00 5,206.00 5,206.00 5,131.00 5,131.00
50 CONSTRUCT SURCHARGE OVER BOX CULVERTS 3,260 CY 6.00 19,560.00 5.00 16,300.00 3.98 12,974.80 5.95 19,397.00
51 SAW CUT 323 LF 3.35 1,082.05 5.45 1,760.35 4.69 1,514.87 6.65 2,147.95
52 CONSTRUCT CONCRETE HEADER 25 LF 30.00 750.00 20.00 500.00 11.66 291.50 17.35 433.75
53 CONSTRUCT TYPE A RIP-RAP 35 ™ 90.00 3,150.00 69.00 2,415.00 94.14 3,294.90 96.00 3,360.00
54 TEMPORARY 48" CGMP 190 LF 175.00 33,250.00 125.00 23,750.00 178.49 33,913.10 218.90 41,591.00
55 CONSTRUCT 18” STORM SEWER TAP 1 EA 1,000.00 1,000.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 1,132.19 1,132.19 676.80 676.80
56 CONSTRUCT 36" STORM SEWER TAP 1 EA 1,200.00 1,200.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 1,390.79 1,390.79 972.20 972.20
TOTAL BASE BID (ITEMS 1-47, 49-56) $4,096,168.05 $4,089,505.15 NO BID $4,205,630.01
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID (ITEMS 1-7, 9-56) $4,046,988.05 NO BID $4,093,161.42 $4,216,796.25**
Start Date: 4/1/2023 TBN TBN 23-Oct




L.G. Roloff Construction Co.,
10204 S 152nd Street
Omaha, NE 68037

Chas. Vrana & Son Construction
4816 F Street
Omaha, NE 68117

Bid Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 REMOVE END OF ROAD MARKER 18 EA 35.00 630.00 76.00 1,368.00
2 REMOVE CONCRETE HEADER 150 LF 10.00 1,500.00 16.00 2,400.00
3 CONSTRUCT 7" CONCRETE PAVEMENT (TYPE L65 W/ INTEGRAL CURB) 32,592 | SY 55.30 1,802,337.60 52.65 1,715,968.80
4 SUBGRADE PREPARATION 10,864 | CY 5.40 58,665.60 8.50 92,344.00
5 TIE BARS 60 EA 13.00 780.00 17.00 1,020.00
6 EXCAVATION ON-SITE (ESTABLISHED QUANTITY) 5,000 CY 4.00 20,000.00 5.50 27,500.00
7 ADJUST MANHOLE TO GRADE 69 EA 300.00 20,700.00 751.00 51,819.00
8 8'-0" x 12'-0" BOX CULVERT 108 LE | mmemee ] e | e | emmeee
9 CONSTRUCT 18" RCP, CLASS llI 3,336 LF 61.86 206,364.96 78.00 260,208.00
10 CONSTRUCT 24" RCP, CLASS Il 979 LF 84.86 83,077.94 103.00 100,837.00
11 CONSTRUCT 30" RCP, CLASS Il 982 LF 113.79 111,741.78 134.00 131,588.00
12 CONSTRUCT 36" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 1,426 LF 149.40 213,044.40 173.00 246,698.00
13 CONSTRUCT 42" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 678 LF 207.95 140,990.10 236.00 160,008.00
14 CONSTRUCT 48" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 710 LF 246.95 175,334.50 276.00 195,960.00
15 CONSTRUCT 54" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 154 EA 297.19 45,767.26 327.00 50,358.00
16 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET - TYPE | 39 EA 4,750.00 185,250.00 4,477.00 174,603.00
17 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET - TYPE lll 16 EA 6,030.00 96,480.00 4,146.00 66,336.00
18 CONSTRUCT 54" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (23) 158 VF 925.00 146,150.00 1,300.00 205,400.00
19 CONSTRUCT 60" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (6) 53 VF 935.00 49,555.00 1,350.00 71,550.00
20 CONSTRUCT 72" 1.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (3) 25 VF 1,235.00 30,875.00 1,600.00 40,000.00
21 CONSTRUCT 60" AREA INLET - TYPE Il 18 VF 970.00 17,460.00 951.00 17,118.00
22 CONSTRUCT 24" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 2,575.00 2,575.00 3,571.00 3,571.00
23 CONSTRUCT 36" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 3,450.00 3,450.00 4,200.00 4,200.00
24 CONSTRUCT 42" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 4,590.00 4,590.00 4,839.00 4,839.00
25 CONSTRUCT 48" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 5,322.00 5,322.00 5,184.00 5,184.00
26 CONSTRUCT 54" RC FLARED END SECTION 1 EA 6,600.00 6,600.00 5,529.00 5,529.00
27 CONSTRUCT 30" PIPE PLUG 1 EA 275.00 275.00 650.00 650.00
28 REMOVE 18" PIPE PLUG 3 EA 85.00 255.00 450.00 1,350.00
29 REMOVE 30" PIPE PLUG 1 EA 123.00 123.00 450.00 450.00
30 INSTALL PIPE COUPLERS 15 EA 160.00 2,400.00 250.00 3,750.00
31 CONSTRUCT TYPE B RIP-RAP 246 ™ 89.60 22,041.60 109.00 26,814.00
32 CONSTRUCT TYPE C RIP-RAP 59 ™ 89.60 5,286.40 110.00 6,490.00
33 CONSTRUCT STREET NAME SIGN 30 EA 150.00 4,500.00 116.00 3,480.00
34 CONSTRUCT SIGN POST 15 EA 150.00 2,250.00 158.00 2,370.00
35 INSTALL SEEDING - TYPE A 2,500 SY 0.54 1,350.00 1.00 2,500.00
36 INSTALL EROSION CONTROL MATTING 2,500 SY 1.19 2,975.00 3.00 7,500.00
37 INSTALL SILT FENCE 500 LF 2.98 1,490.00 3.00 1,500.00
38 JET EXISTING SANITARY SEWER 10,138 LF 0.92 9,326.96 1.00 10,138.00
39 PROVIDE TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LS 3,000.00 3,000.00 2,056.00 2,056.00

40 CONSTRUCT 6" PCC MEDIAN SURFACING 246 SF 10.40 2,558.40 14.00 3,444.00
41 INSTALL PERMANENT PAINT MARKING - 5" WHITE 100 LF 6.62 662.00 5.50 550.00
42 CONSTRUCT END OF ROAD MARKER 3 EA 380.11 1,140.33 278.50 835.50
43 STAIN & SEAL 950 SF 7.33 6,963.50 7.25 6,887.50
44 WINGWALLS/ HEADWALLS - KESTREL PARKWAY 2,950 SF 85.05 250,897.50 84.50 249,275.00
45 CONSTRUCT 72" AREA INLET - TYPE Il 20 VF 1,400.00 28,000.00 2,148.00 42,960.00
46 REMOVE SURCHARGE 6,500 CY 4.78 31,070.00 8.50 55,250.00
47 REMOVE 48" CGMP 190 LF 39.10 7,429.00 38.00 7,220.00
48 8'-0" x 12'-0" PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT 107 LF 3,370.00 360,590.00 2,199.00 235,293.00
49 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET — TYPE Il 1 EA 4,750.00 4,750.00 4,487.00 4,487.00
50 CONSTRUCT SURCHARGE OVER BOX CULVERTS 3,260 CY 5.00 16,300.00 5.00 16,300.00
51 SAW CUT 323 LF 6.35 2,051.05 5.50 1,776.50
52 CONSTRUCT CONCRETE HEADER 25 LF 20.00 500.00 40.00 1,000.00
53 CONSTRUCT TYPE A RIP-RAP 35 ™ 90.00 3,150.00 94.00 3,290.00
54 TEMPORARY 48" CGMP 190 LF 145.50 27,645.00 141.50 26,885.00
55 CONSTRUCT 18" STORM SEWER TAP 1 EA 950.00 950.00 911.00 911.00
56 CONSTRUCT 36” STORM SEWER TAP 1 EA 1,300.00 1,300.00 1,148.00 1,148.00
TOTAL BASE BID (ITEMS 1-47, 49-56) NO BID NO BID
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID (ITEMS 1-7, 9-56) $4,230,470.88 $4,362,967.30




